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Akerman continues to be ranked by Law360 among
the top 10 law firms with more than 600 lawyers for
diversity and inclusion. With Akerman positioned at
number 8 on the 2022 Diversity Snapshot, the list
recognizes firms with high combined diversity
scores, based on individual assessments of their
partner, associate, and other (counsel and staff
attorney) diversity counts, naming those with the
highest combined scores regarding overall
representation of minorities.

“At Akerman, we tirelessly strive to bring together
people of diverse backgrounds, skills and ideas and
to empower them to succeed at all levels of our firm,”
said Akerman Chairman and CEO Scott Meyers.
“While we are proud of our recognition in Law360’s
Diversity Snapshot, we understand that there is
much more work to be done here, and we remain
focused on continuing the vital work that remains
ahead to further our commitment to equality and
inclusion.”

Law360, a subsidiary of international business
information services company LexisNexis, reaches
1.5 million readers a day through its more than 70
subscription-only newsletters.

About Akerman

https://www.akerman.com/en/people/scott-meyers.html
https://www.akerman.com/en/index.html


Akerman LLP is a top 100 U.S. law firm recognized
among the most forward-thinking firms in the
industry by Financial Times. Its more than 700
lawyers and business professionals collaborate with
the world’s most successful enterprises and
entrepreneurs to navigate change, seize
opportunities, and help drive innovation and growth.
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