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Top 100 U.S. law firm Akerman LLP is pleased to
announce that Corporate Partner Dale Cohen has
been honored among Business Woman Magazine’s
50 Era-Defining Women to Watch in 2023. The list
celebrates the key figureheads, disruptors, and up-
and-comers working in the international franchise
space. The powerhouse females have changed the
industry for the better.

Cohen focuses her practice on domestic and
international franchising, distribution, and licensing
law. She advises new emerging brands as well as
widely recognized mature brands with respect to
structuring and implementing their franchise,
distribution, and licensing programs. Her experience
includes drafting agreements and preparing
domestic and international franchise and master
franchise disclosure documents (FDDs); securing
registration and/or exemptions from applicable
franchise and business opportunity laws
internationally; structuring, drafting and negotiating
complex system-wide supplier agreements;
establishing and helping to implement domestic and
international franchise compliance programs; and
counseling franchisors on such franchise
relationship issues as termination and strategies to
avoid and resolve disputes. 
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Akerman LLP is a top 100 U.S. law firm recognized
among the most forward-thinking firms in the
industry by Financial Times. Its more than 700
lawyers and business professionals collaborate with
the world’s most successful enterprises and
entrepreneurs to navigate change, seize
opportunities, and help drive innovation and growth.


