
Speaking Engagements

Jonathan Awner to Moderate Panel at the
18th Independent Sponsors Summit
& Awards
March 4, 2025 to March 5, 2025

The Ritz-Carlton Coconut Grove

3300 SW 27th Avenue

Miami, Florida

Jonathan Awner, Co-Chair of Akerman’s Corporate
Practice Group, will moderate the keynote panel
titled “Deal Flow and Growth: Unlocking Miami-
Dade’s Investment Potential” at the 18th Independent
Sponsors Summit & Awards, presented by iGlobal
Forum.

The panel will feature James Kohnstamm, Executive
Vice President, Economic Development for Miami-
Dade, as he uncovers how the region’s dynamic
growth is creating prime opportunities for mid-
market and lower middle-market M&A activity. This
session will spotlight Miami-Dade’s high-growth
sectors—such as technology, healthcare, and
logistics—and provide actionable insights on how
independent sponsors and capital providers can
capitalize on the region’s economic momentum. 

Akerman is also a sponsor of this two day event, the
go-to platform for independent sponsors and capital
providers to connect, network, and share insights on
structuring, sourcing, financing, and executing
transactions. 
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Register
Click here to register for this event.

https://events.iglobalforum.com/independent-sponsors-summit

