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BTI Consulting recognized Akerman’s client service
in its “The Mad Clientist” listing, highlighting the
firm in the Midsize Heavyweight category. The
organization considered firms with the ability to
help clients navigate “thorny matters – including
highly customized advice about reopening and
related issues.” 

BTI Consulting pointed out Akerman is among the
firms offering superb client service, saying, “These
firms are uber-responsive, dig deep, hard, and fast to
find the answers. Always quick to embrace new
approaches to billing and problems, these firms
make sure clients always know who is accountable
for their work and the relationship. Clients report
these firms bring industry understanding and the
most important factor – an unfailing commitment to
help.” 

This latest recognition is a testament to Akerman’s
dedication to client service and its continued ability
to meet evolving client needs, including in times of
high uncertainty and volatility. For five consecutive
years, the Financial Times has highlighted Akerman
among the United States’ most innovative law firms
for revolutionizing the way it assists clients. 

Click here to view this news.

https://bticonsulting.com/themadclientist/clients-single-out-37-midsize-law-firms-punching-way-above-their-weight
https://www.akerman.com/en/index.html



