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Top 100 U.S. law firm Akerman LLP is pleased to
announce that Real Estate partner Stacy Bercun
Bohm has been named among GlobeSt. Real Estate
Forum’s 2021 Women of Influence within the CRE
Legal Counsel category. Since 1983, GlobeSt. Real
Estate Forum has recognized a growing number of
commercial real estate female professionals for their
remarkable achievements. These individuals have
personally impacted the market and have
significantly driven the industry to new heights
through their outstanding successes.

Board Certified by The Florida Bar in Construction
Law and a LEED® Accredited Professional, Bohm
represents developers, contractors, subcontractors,
and design professionals in complex construction
contract, project administration, and litigation
matters. She is one of the first lawyers in Florida to
achieve both Board Certification and LEED
accreditation. Chambers USA states, “She
understands the industry and brings that knowledge
to negotiations.”

GlobeSt.com’s trusted and independent team of
experts provides commercial real estate owners,
investors, developers, brokers and finance
professionals with comprehensive coverage,
analysis and best practices necessary to innovate
and build their businesses. They celebrate those that
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are adapting and succeeding in new ways, translate
the impact of macro issues, local market trends and
emerging technologies into digestible, shareable
information that can be immediately put into real-
life practice.

About Akerman

Akerman LLP is a top 100 U.S. law firm recognized
among the most forward thinking firms in the
industry by Financial Times. Its more than 700
lawyers and business professionals collaborate with
the world’s most successful enterprises and
entrepreneurs to navigate change, seize
opportunities, and help drive innovation and growth.


